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Details
The EGO Power+ 25in Hedge Trimmer has a high-
efficiency brushless motor which allows for longer
run time, low vibrations and extended tool life The
25in dual action, laser cut steel blades allow
lprecise, clean cuts. The trimmer is also equipped
with fully serviceable blades to make sharpening
quick and easy. The 180-degree rotating handles
offer ultimate control in challenging conditions.
Delivering up to 3,200 stroke per minute to get the
tough jobs done fThe EGO Power+ 25in Hedge
Trimmer has a high-efficiency brushless motor
which allows for longer run time, low vibrations and
extended tool life The 25in dual action, laser cut
steel blades allow lprecise, clean cuts. The trimmer
is also equipped with fully serviceable blades to
make sharpening quick and easy. The 180-degree
rotating handles offer ultimate control in
challenging conditions. Delivering up to 3,200 stroke
per minute to get the tough jobs done faster.
Compatible with all EGO Power+ ARC Lithium
batteries to deliver Power Beyond Belief. Please
note: This product is restricted from air freight, and
will only be shipped ground freight

Specifications
Manufacturer EGO

Replacement Parts
REGCH2100 EGO 210w Power+ 56

Volt Charger

EGO 25in Hedge Trimmer - Includes G3
2.5AH Battery & 210w Charger
REGHT2501


